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In this melancholy novel about a man on the brink of suicide, Stanley Crawford allows readers to question
what it really means to be close to a person. Intimacy follows an unnamed narrator planning his own death.
His preparations become a trigger and occasion for him to revisit key moments in his life and his material
possessions, which are the solid artifacts from his life’s journey.

 

As sparrows in flight might form a single arrow, the life of the narrator comes into focus as a collage of
fleeting events and images. Readers gain insights into tiny moments that slowly build into a picture of a man
who seems to have very little, aside from material possessions, to lose.

 

The narrative pulls the reader along a trail of digressions—about running shoes, about the symbolism of
rings—that lead down a proverbial rabbit hole until we realize the narrator’s intentions. Despite our lack of
concrete knowledge about the narrator’s life, he allows us to share his thought processes: how every thought
leads to the next, how memories seep upward when he picks up a particular T-shirt, or when he glimpses his
car keys. And alongside our growing understanding of the narrator comes a recognition of our own thought
processes: how we, like him, relate to our bodies; how we, too, cannot break away from the constant motion
of our thoughts.

 

Intimacy is a brief, intense novel charged with the heightened sense of closeness that comes from watching a
man’s last hours. It illuminates how brief snapshots of memory can trace the outline of an entire life.
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From reader reviews:

Lisa McCann:

Now a day those who Living in the era just where everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not need people to be aware of each facts they get. How a lot more to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Looking at a
book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information especially this Intimacy: A Novel book as this book
offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred percent guarantees there
is no doubt in it you may already know.

Tommy Heckman:

The guide with title Intimacy: A Novel has a lot of information that you can study it. You can get a lot of
benefit after read this book. This specific book exist new information the information that exist in this book
represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement
of the world. This kind of book will bring you with new era of the the positive effect. You can read the e-
book on your own smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Jennifer Case:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this Intimacy: A Novel reserve written by
well-known writer whose to say well how to make book that can be understand by anyone who have read the
book. Written with good manner for you, dripping every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your
current hunger then you still hesitation Intimacy: A Novel as good book not merely by the cover but also
through the content. This is one e-book that can break don't assess book by its cover, so do you still needing
yet another sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already told you so why you
have to listening to another sixth sense.

Santiago Johnson:

You may spend your free time to see this book this book. This Intimacy: A Novel is simple to develop you
can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not have much space to bring
often the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save the actual
book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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