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Imagining Transgender is an ethnography of the emergence and institutionalization of transgender as a
category of collective identity and political activism. Embraced by activists in the early 1990s to advocate for
gender-variant people, the category quickly gained momentum in public health, social service, scholarly, and
legislative contexts. Working as a safer-sex activist in Manhattan during the late 1990s, David Valentine
conducted ethnographic research among mostly male-to-female transgender-identified people at drag balls,
support groups, cross-dresser organizations, clinics, bars, and clubs. However, he found that many of those
labeled “transgender” by activists did not know the term or resisted its use. Instead, they self-identified as
“gay,” a category of sexual rather than gendered identity and one rejected in turn by the activists who
claimed these subjects as transgender. Valentine analyzes the reasons for and potential consequences of this
difference, and how social theory is implicated in it.

Valentine argues that “transgender” has been adopted so rapidly in the contemporary United States because it
clarifies a model of gender and sexuality that has been gaining traction within feminism, psychiatry, and
mainstream gay and lesbian politics since the 1970s: a paradigm in which gender and sexuality are distinct
arenas of human experience. This distinction and the identity categories based on it erase the experiences of
some gender-variant people—particularly poor persons of color—who conceive of gender and sexuality in
other terms. While recognizing the important advances transgender has facilitated, Valentine argues that a
broad vision of social justice must include, simultaneously, an attentiveness to the politics of language and a
recognition of how social theoretical models and broader political economies are embedded in the day-to-day
politics of identity.
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From reader reviews:

Kathryn Glover:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they are still students or this for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that problem above. Every person
has several personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't
want do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Imagining Transgender: An
Ethnography of a Category. All type of book can you see on many resources. You can look for the internet
options or other social media.

Andrew Nixon:

This Imagining Transgender: An Ethnography of a Category book is simply not ordinary book, you have
after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book is usually information
inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of
information you will get. This kind of Imagining Transgender: An Ethnography of a Category without we
realize teach the one who studying it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't become worry
Imagining Transgender: An Ethnography of a Category can bring whenever you are and not make your bag
space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even cellphone. This
Imagining Transgender: An Ethnography of a Category having good arrangement in word as well as layout,
so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Martin Herrin:

The guide untitled Imagining Transgender: An Ethnography of a Category is the book that recommended to
you to see. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to you. The language that
publisher use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The author was did a lot of
analysis when write the book, so the information that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate.
You also will get the e-book of Imagining Transgender: An Ethnography of a Category from the publisher to
make you more enjoy free time.

Danny Padilla:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the extra time or they will get great
deal of stress from both daily life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you
possess when the spare time coming to you of course your answer can unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading publications. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the particular book you have
read is actually Imagining Transgender: An Ethnography of a Category.
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