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In the summer of 1812 Britain stood alone, fighting for her very survival against a vast European Empire.
Only the Royal Navy stood between Napoleon's legions and ultimate victory. In that dark hour America saw
its chance to challenge British dominance: her troops invaded Canada and American frigates attacked British
merchant shipping, the lifeblood of British defence.

War polarised America. The south and west wanted land, the north wanted peace and trade. But America had
to choose between the oceans and the continent. Within weeks the land invasion had stalled, but American
warships and privateers did rather better, and astonished the world by besting the Royal Navy in a series of
battles.

Then in three titanic single ship actions the challenge was decisively met. British frigates closed with the
Chesapeake, the Essex and the President, flagship of American naval ambition. Both sides found new heroes
but none could equal Captain Philip Broke, champion of history's greatest frigate battle, when HMS Shannon
captured the USS Chesapeake in thirteen blood-soaked minutes. Broke's victory secured British control of
the Atlantic, and within a year Washington, D.C. had been taken and burnt by British troops.

Andrew Lambert, Laughton Professor of Naval History in the Department of War Studies at King's College
London, brings all his mastery of the subject and narrative brilliance to throw new light on a war which until
now has been much mythologised, little understood.
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From reader reviews:

Lois Cox:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider any time those information which is within the former life are difficult to be find than now is taking
seriously which one would work to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you have the unstable
resource then you buy it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All of those
possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take The Challenge: Britain Against America in the Naval
War of 1812 as your daily resource information.

Lucile Brown:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or go to the outside with them household or their
friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or playing video
games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different you can read some
sort of book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent all day
every day to reading a reserve. The book The Challenge: Britain Against America in the Naval War of 1812
it is very good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. These people were enjoying
reading this book. If you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy often the e-book. You
can m0ore very easily to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book
provides high quality.

Gemma Jackson:

The book untitled The Challenge: Britain Against America in the Naval War of 1812 contain a lot of
information on the item. The writer explains your ex idea with easy way. The language is very clear and
understandable all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was authored
by famous author. The author will bring you in the new era of literary works. It is possible to read this book
because you can read on your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book within anywhere and
anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can available their official web-site along with order it. Have a
nice study.

Willie Long:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will
make someone to understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
much easier to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet,
newspapers, book, and soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The
book that recommended for your requirements is The Challenge: Britain Against America in the Naval War
of 1812 this guide consist a lot of the information in the condition of this world now. This kind of book was



represented just how can the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer use for explain it is easy to
understand. Often the writer made some investigation when he makes this book. That's why this book ideal
all of you.
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