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From acclaimed author Alexander C. Irvine comes a gritty near-future thriller in the paranoid, prophetic vein
of Philip K. Dick and Richard K. Morgan.

One hundred years from now, with Americans hooked into an Internet far more expansive and intrusive than
today’s, the world has become a seamless market-driven experience. In this culture of capitalism run amok,
entrepreneurs and politicians faced with rampant overcrowding in the nation’s penal system turn to a
controversial new method of cutting costs: life-term buyouts. In theory, buyouts offer convicted murderers
the chance to atone for their crimes by voluntarily allowing themselves to be put to death by the state in
exchange for a one-time cash payment, shared among their heirs and victims, based on a percentage of what
it would have cost taxpayers to house and feed them for the rest of their natural lives. It’s a win-win
situation.

At least that’s what Martin Kindred believes. And Martin is a man who desperately needs something to
believe in, especially with his marriage coming apart and the murder of his brother, an L.A. cop brutally
gunned down in the line of duty, unsolved.

As the public face of the buyout program, Martin is a lightning rod for verbal and physical abuse–but he
embraces every challenge, knowing his motives are pure. But when evidence comes to light that a felon in
line for a buyout may have been involved with his brother’s death, Martin’s professional detachment
threatens to turn into a personal vendetta that will jeopardize everything–and everyone–he holds dear.
Inspired by today’s politics, Buyout is an unforgettable look at an all-too-believable future . . . and one man’s
struggle to do the right thing.

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

David Chambers:

This Buyout book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit
you will get by reading this book is definitely information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get
data which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get. This particular Buyout without we
comprehend teach the one who examining it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't possibly be
worry Buyout can bring when you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' grow to be full because
you can have it in your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This Buyout having very good arrangement in
word as well as layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

June Edwards:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also be a life style. This reading practice give you lot of
advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge even the information inside the book in which
improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of e-book you read, if
you want get more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want feel happy read one using
theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The actual Buyout is kind of publication which is giving the
reader unstable experience.

Patricia Ables:

Beside this specific Buyout in your phone, it may give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or
facts. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from your oven so don't end up being
worry if you feel like an older people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have Buyout because this
book offers to your account readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you would not get what
it's exactly about. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable blend here
cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss this? Find this book
along with read it from at this point!

Cynthia Carter:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many question for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people
likes reading through, not only science book but additionally novel and Buyout or even others sources were
given expertise for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you feel desire to read more and more.
Science book was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those books are helping them to include
their knowledge. In different case, beside science book, any other book likes Buyout to make your spare time
far more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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